
The EoF School has reached its 5th 
edition and is ready for a trans-
formation.

We’ll have fewer traditional lectures 
(2 guest speakers) and more interac-
tive lectorials (6 sessions). These will 
include active student participation 
through fishbowl methodology and 
breakout rooms, ensuring a balance 
between academic, entrepreneuri-
al, and change-maker perspectives.

By subscribing, you’ll join an en-
gaging and collaborative learning 
journey, exploring core topics that 
the EoF community has focused on 
over the past five years. Each topic 
connects to one of the three Franc-
escos of EoF: Pope Francis, St. Fran-
cis of Assisi, and the EoF youth com-
munity.

While we continue to feature guest 
lectures (this year by Kate Raworth 
and Jennifer Nedelsky), our focus 
shifts to creating an educational 
space where we receive and co-cre-
ate knowledge among people with-
in the EoF community. Our new 
lectorials—combining lectures and 
tutorials—will group students by 
interests, fostering small communi-
ties within the school.

Join us in transforming the learning
experience and walking the steps
of the Economy of Francesco!



https://docs.google.com/forms/d/e/1FAIpQLSd5TMDmDglcvvcDCr4UuuwbHLa8TDVkrhHeAvEe6O0e-u3jnQ/viewform

